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2025 MLB All-Star Week Programming on
SiriusXM

SiriusXM will air live coverage of the 95th All-Star Game Presented by Mastercard, T-
Mobile Home Run Derby and MLB Draft Presented by Nike

SiriusXM’s Jim Bowden, Jim Duquette, Cole Tucker, Dani Wexelman, Mike Ferrin and
Grant Paulsen to host special programming from Truist Park in Atlanta

NEW YORK – July 8, 2025 – SiriusXM will offer listeners nationwide coverage of the events
of Major League Baseball’s 2025 All-Star Week, with live broadcasts of the 95th All-Star
Game Presented by Mastercard, the T-Mobile Home Run Derby, the MLB Draft Presented
by Nike, and more special programming from Atlanta, GA.

On Sunday, July 13, starting at 5pm ET, SiriusXM’s MLB Network Radio channel will offer
live coverage of the first round of the MLB Draft Presented by Nike, from the Coca-Cola
Roxy in The Battery Atlanta. SiriusXM listeners will hear the live selections of every team in
the first round. SiriusXM’s Dani Wexelman and Grant Paulsen will host alongside former
MLB general managers Jim Bowden and Jim Duquette, two longtime pro personnel experts
who will react to picks and share their analysis. 

For Monday’s T-Mobile Home Run Derby, SiriusXM’s on-site programming from Truist Park
will begin at 2 pm ET with a Media Day show hosted by Dani Wexelman, Jim Duquette and
Grant Paulsen. At 5 pm ET Mike Ferrin, Jim Bowden and former big leaguer Cole Tucker will
be on the field to host SiriusXM’s pre-game programming and interview many of the All-
Stars in attendance. The MLB Network Radio channel will air ESPN Radio’s broadcast of the
Home Run Derby starting at 8 pm ET. 

On Tuesday, July 15, MLB Network Radio’s coverage of the MLB All-Star Game Presented
by Mastercard begins at 5 pm ET with an MLB All-Star Pregame Show hosted by Mike
Ferrin, Cole Tucker and Jim Duquette. Listeners will hear interviews with many of the
coaches and players on the field at Truist Park The pre-game show will lead into ESPN
Radio’s play-by-play broadcast of the All-Star Game starting at 8 pm ET.

Beyond the special coverage of these All-Star Weekend events, MLB Network Radio offers
baseball fans a daily lineup of MLB talk 365 days a year, featuring shows hosted by former
players, managers, front office executives and other baseball insiders. The exclusive 24/7
channel is available to listeners nationwide in their cars on channel 89 and on the SiriusXM
app: https://sxm.app.link/MLBonSXM. 

In honor of the Midsummer Classic being played in Atlanta, MLB Network Radio will also be
re-airing three Atlanta Braves-themed episodes of “The Road to Cooperstown” podcast,
which is a collaboration between SiriusXM and the National Baseball Hall of Fame and
Museum. Listeners will hear in-depth conversations between SiriusXM host Jon Morosi and
legendary Braves John Smoltz, Chipper Jones and Tom Glavine as they share memories

https://sxm.app.link/MLBonSXM
https://sxm.app.link/MLBonSXM
https://podcasts.apple.com/us/podcast/the-road-to-cooperstown/id1748842135
https://podcasts.apple.com/us/podcast/john-smoltz-class-of-2015/id1748842135?i=1000659362268
https://podcasts.apple.com/us/podcast/chipper-jones-class-of-2018/id1748842135?i=1000712213607
https://podcasts.apple.com/us/podcast/tom-glavine-class-of-2014/id1748842135?i=1000663764788


from their extraordinary lives and careers on their journey to the Hall of Fame.

### 

About Sirius XM Holdings Inc.

SiriusXM is the leading audio entertainment company in North America with a portfolio of
audio businesses including its flagship subscription entertainment service SiriusXM; the ad-
supported and premium music streaming services of Pandora; an expansive podcast
network; and a suite of business and advertising solutions. Reaching a combined monthly
audience of approximately 160 million listeners, SiriusXM offers a broad range of content for
listeners everywhere they tune in with a diverse mix of live, on-demand, and curated
programming across music, talk, news, and sports. For more about SiriusXM, please go to:
www.siriusxm.com.
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