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AMD Delivers Significant Graphics
Performance and Compatibility
Enhancements for Consumer Linux Users
ATI Radeon(TM) HD 2000 Series, Accelerated Indirect GLX Support and
Increased Gaming Performance Highlight Most Significant Series of
CAtalyst(TM) Software Enhancements Ever for Linux Users

SUNNYVALE, Calif.--(BUSINESS WIRE)--

AMD (NYSE: AMD) today announced plans to extend its leadership position in graphics
software with major enhancements to performance and compatibility for ATI Radeon(TM)
graphics for consumer Linux users. These improvements are planned for subsequent
releases of ATI's Catalyst(TM) software package beginning in early September. This
announcement represents a significant first step in redefining the graphics landscape for
Linux consumer users. Moving forward, AMD also plans to accelerate efforts to address the
needs of the open source community as well.

"As client computing on Linux continues to grow so has our support and focus on delivering
best-in-class performance and compatibility for our products," said Ben Bar-Haim, vice
president of software, Graphics Product Group at AMD. "In the second half of 2007 we plan
to deliver the most significant enhancements for ATI Radeon graphics ever for Linux and
reaffirm our commitment to consumer users and the community as a whole."

With the forthcoming Catalyst 7.9 software release in September, AMD will add Linux
support for the ATI Radeon(TM) HD 2000 series of graphics processors. The Radeon HD
2000 series offer a number of compelling new features for Linux users including AMD's
patented unified shader architecture.

In addition to expanded GPU support, Catalyst(TM) 7.9 is being designed to offer a number
of major performance improvements across the board with users seeing up to 90 per cent
improvement in such popular titles as Doom 3 and Quake 4
(http://www.phoronix.com/scan.php?page=article&item=823&num=3). In Q4 2007, AMD's
Catalyst software package for Linux will add support for Accelerated Indirect GLX (AIGLX).
AIGLX is an enabling technology that allows Linux users to enjoy a rich visual 3D user
interface that provides a more immersive end-user compute experience.

About AMD

Advanced Micro Devices (NYSE: AMD) is a leading global provider of innovative processing
solutions in the computing, graphics and consumer electronics markets. AMD is dedicated to
driving open innovation, choice and industry growth by delivering superior customer-centric
solutions that empower consumers and businesses worldwide. For more information, visit
www.amd.com.
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Cautionary Statement

This release contains forward-looking statements concerning, among other things, future
and planned products, technologies, specifications, features, performance and introduction
schedules, which are made pursuant to the safe harbor provisions of the Private Securities
Litigation Reform Act of 1995. Forward-looking statements are commonly identified by words
such as "would," "may," "expects," "believes," "plans," "intends," "projects" and other terms
with similar meaning. Investors are cautioned that the forward-looking statements in this
release are based on current beliefs, assumptions and expectations, speak only as of the
date of this release and involve risks and uncertainties that could cause actual results to
differ materially from current expectations. Risks include the possibility that Intel
Corporation's pricing, marketing and rebating programs, product bundling, standard setting,
new product introductions or other activities targeting AMD's business will prevent attainment
of AMD's current plans; AMD will require additional funding and may not be able to raise
funds on favorable terms or at all; customers stop buying AMD's products or materially
reduce their operations or demand for its products; AMD will be unable to develop, launch
and ramp new products and technologies in the volumes and mix required by the market
and at mature yields on a timely basis; global business and economic conditions will worsen;
AMD will be unable to transition to advanced manufacturing process technologies in a timely
and effective way; and AMD will be unable to maintain the requisite level of investment in
research and development and capacity. Investors are urged to review in detail the risks and
uncertainties in AMD's Securities and Exchange Commission filings, including but not limited
to the Quarterly Report on Form 10-Q for the quarter ended June 30, 2007.

(a) Testing of Catalyst 7.9 done by Phoronix. http://www.phoronix.com/scan.php?
page=article&item=823&num=3. Test setup consisted of dual Intel(R) Xeon E5320
"Clovertown" processors, 4GB of DDR2 FB-DIMM RAM, Tyan Tempest i5000XT
motherboard, OCZ ModXStream 780W PSU, and a Seagate 7200.9 300GB HDD. Phoronix
used Fedora 7 with the Linux 2.6.22.4 kernel and X server 1.3. The ATI Radeon X1300PRO,
ATI Radeon X1800XL, ATI Radeon X1800XT, and ATI Radeon X1950PRO were all PCI
Express x16 based and each had 256MB of video memory.
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