
July 19, 2021

Rollins, Inc. Named to Top 50 Green Fleet
List
Company Ranks #17 For Its Use of Green Vehicles Across All Brands

ATLANTA, July 19, 2021 /PRNewswire/ -- Rollins, Inc. (NYSE: ROL), a premier global
consumer and commercial services company, has been named #17 on Automotive Fleet's
2021 list of Top 50 Green Fleets, making it a company with one of the largest "green" vehicle
fleets in the U.S.

"We are committed to increasing our numbers of alternative-fuel vehicles to be better
stewards of the environment," said Chris Gorecki, Vice President of Operational Support for
Rollins, Inc. "We're consistently assessing new solutions that generate sustainable
efficiencies for the business. We are proud of how far we've come but know there is still
much to be done across our large fleet."

The Automotive Fleet's 2021 list represents more than 92,000 vehicles – everything from
compressed natural gas (CNG), propane autogas and flex fuel to hybrid electric, electric,
biodiesel, and liquefied natural gas (LNG) vehicles. Automotive Fleet's listing offers a full
breakdown of all the alternative vehicles operated by each company on the list as well as the
total number of green vehicles in each fleet.

As Rollins moves forward in the 21st Century, sustainability, stewardship, and shareholder
engagement are at the core of our business. We constantly strive to uphold our values in
sustainability, while making innovations to improve our service programs through new
technologies and processes. Our annual sustainability report is available here.

About Rollins
Rollins, Inc. is a premier global consumer and commercial services company. Through its
family of leading brands, Orkin, HomeTeam Pest Defense, Clark Pest Control, Orkin
Canada, Western Pest Services, Northwest Exterminating, McCall Service, Critter Control,
The Industrial Fumigant Company, Trutech, Orkin Australia, Waltham Services, OPC
Services, PermaTreat, Rollins UK, Aardwolf Pestkare, and Crane Pest Control, MissQuito,
the Company provides essential pest control services and protection against termite
damage, rodents and insects to more than two million customers in North America, South
America, Europe, Asia, Africa, and Australia from more than 700 locations. You can learn
more about Rollins and its subsidiaries by visiting our web sites at www.orkin.com,
www.pestdefense.com, www.clarkpest.com, www.orkincanada.ca, www.westernpest.com,
www.callnorthwest.com, www.mccallservice.com, www.crittercontrol.com,
www.indfumco.com, www.trutechinc.com, www.orkinau.com, www.walthamservices.com,
www.opcpest.com, www.permatreat.com, www.safeguardpestcontrol.co.uk,
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www.aardwolfpestkare.com, www.cranepestcontrol.com, www.missquito.com and
www.rollins.com. You can also find this and other news releases at www.rollins.com by
accessing the news releases button.

CAUTION CONCERNING FORWARD-LOOKING STATEMENTS

Certain statements in this release constitute "forward-looking statements." These statements
are based on management's current opinions, expectations, beliefs, plans, objectives,
assumptions or projections regarding future events or future results. These forward-looking
statements are only predictions, not historical fact, and involve certain risks and
uncertainties, as well as assumptions. Actual results, levels of activity, performance,
achievements and events could differ materially from those stated, anticipated or implied by
such forward-looking statements. While the Company believes that its assumptions are
reasonable, it is very difficult to predict the impact of known factors, and, of course, it is
impossible to anticipate all factors that could affect actual results. There are many risks and
uncertainties that could cause actual results to differ materially from forward-looking
statements made herein including, most prominently, the risks discussed in the Company's
periodic reports filed with the U.S. Securities and Exchange Commission. Such forward-
looking statements are made only as of the date of this release. The Company undertakes
no obligation to publicly update or revise any forward-looking statement because of new
information, future events or otherwise, except as otherwise required by law. If we do update
one or more forward-looking statements, no inference should be made that we will make
additional updates with respect to those or other forward-looking statements.

For Further Information Contact
Eddie Northen, (404) 888-2242

 View original content:https://www.prnewswire.com/news-releases/rollins-inc-named-to-
top-50-green-fleet-list-301336005.html
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