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OPERATOR INSTRUCTIONS 

Good afternoon and welcome to Sunrun’s fourth quarter and full year 2024 earnings conference call.  
Please note that this call is being recorded and that one hour has been allocated for the call, including the 
Q&A session.  To join the Q&A session after prepared remarks, please press star 1 at any time.  We ask 
participants to limit themselves to one question and one follow-up question.   I will now turn the call over to 
Patrick Jobin, Sunrun’s Investor Relations Officer. 

PATRICK JOBIN 

Thank you operator.  

Before we begin, please note that certain remarks we will make on this call constitute forward-looking 
statements. Although we believe these statements reflect our best judgment based on factors currently 
known to us, actual results may differ materially and adversely. Please refer to the Company's filings with 
the SEC for a more inclusive discussion of risks and other factors that may cause our actual results to 
differ from projections made in any forward-looking statements. Please also note these statements are 
being made as of today, and we disclaim any obligation to update or revise them. 

On the call today are Mary Powell, Sunrun’s CEO, Danny Abajian, Sunrun’s CFO, and Paul Dickson, 
Sunrun’s President and Chief Revenue Officer.  

A presentation is available on Sunrun’s investor relations website, along with supplemental materials.  An 
audio replay of today’s call, along with a copy of today’s prepared remarks and transcript including Q&A 
will be posted to Sunrun’s investor relations website shortly after the call.  We have allocated 60 minutes 
for today’s call, including the question and answer session.   

And now let me turn the call over to Mary. 

MARY POWELL 

Thank you, Patrick.  

And thank you all for joining us today.  

The fourth quarter was an exceptionally strong quarter for Sunrun and our execution positioned us well for 
2025.  We are delivering high-quality growth, generating meaningful cash, increasing our book value of 
deployed systems and paying down our parent debt.  We are poised to further improve our operating and 
financial results, and deliver a very strong 2025 with meaningful Cash Generation.  

In 2024 we adapted to the rapid increase in interest rates, innovated through changes in state regulations, 
built a robust supply chain with strong domestic content focus, and remained steadfast in the face of 
irrational behavior from several industry participants.  We are improving in every dimension – focusing on 
fast, effective execution, delivering strong financial and operating results, gaining share in a disciplined 
way and building a long-term foundation of valuable grid resources.  Executing on our plan does not 
require equity funding. 

In 2024, we optimized our product mix, prioritized the highest value geographies and routes to market with 
an intense focus on cost efficiency. At the same time, we increased storage attachment rates resulting in 
the highest Net Subscriber Values Sunrun has ever reported.  We have now posted positive Cash 
Generation for three consecutive quarters and expect to do so in every quarter throughout 2025, including 
the first quarter which is seasonally the weakest.  We have allocated excess cash to pay down our parent 
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debt by $186 million since Q1 of last year, while making strategic long-term investments in AI to lower 
costs, streamline operations and create a differentiated customer experience. We also allocated excess 
cash to execute our end-of-year safe harbor equipment purchases to mitigate what we view as unlikely, but 
still potential, policy changes.  

The fundamental long-term demand drivers for our business are incredibly strong and unrelated to any 
political party affiliation.  Americans want greater energy independence and control of their lives and their 
pocketbooks. The country also needs more power –  from all sources – to fuel rapid growth in 
electrification, and datacenters, and our growing fleet of energy resources will be part of the solution.  For 
these reasons, it is no surprise that support for the energy we provide spans across all party lines.  

Turning to more specifics for the quarter. 

In Q4 we grew contracted Total Value Generated, or the aggregate net contracted value of systems 
installed in the quarter, using capital costs observed in Q4, by 125% compared to the prior year and 48% 
compared to the prior quarter.  We did this by growing our customer additions sequentially, and by 
increasing Subscriber Values from higher battery attachment rates and ITC realization while holding our 
Creation Costs flat.    

Cash Generation was $34 million in the quarter.  We elected to invest $18 million of working capital in safe 
harbor equipment, which obviously lowered our Cash Generation result in the quarter.   

In Q4, we also hit all-time highs for storage attachment rates and capacity installed. We installed storage 
for 62% of our new customers, an increase of 17 percentage points from a year ago.  We installed 392 
megawatt hours of storage in Q4, up 78% from a year ago. Our fleet of Networked Storage Capacity has 
reached 2.5 Gigawatt hours with over 156,000 storage systems installed. 

We continue to advance programs that generate value for customers, the grid and Sunrun.  We have 16 
grid service programs active across the country, with over 20,000 customers participating. During 2024, 
Sunrun’s virtual power plants successfully supported power grids across the country with a combined 
instantaneous peak of nearly 80 megawatts – a capacity greater than many traditional fossil-fuel power 
plants. Sunrun is leading in establishing a platform to turn homes and vehicles into smart, controllable load 
that can be dispatched into, and improve, the electric grid.  

Industry Leadership 

I want to spend a minute on what we are seeing in recent industry data.   

We don’t manage to market share – we view our leading position in the industry as a natural long-term 
result of pursuing a customer-first, disciplined growth strategy.  There have been periods with irrational 
competitive behavior – such as pricing and terms loan providers offered a few years ago, and more 
recently, pricing and terms being offered by certain financing-only new entrants –  but our view is that a 
focus on the fundamentals and first-rate execution always prevails in the long-term.  We lead with the best 
customer experience, underwrite healthy and financially sound business, and grow in a sustainable, 
strategic way.  We have seen some new entrants become more rational in recent periods, while others 
continue to scale with uneconomic, cash-consuming activities.  

We have seen our share of residential storage installations expand to over 50% in the US while residential 
solar installations nationwide picked up significantly in the last few quarters – from 13% in Q1 to 19% in 
Q4.  I’m pleased to see these trends, but more pleased that we are doing it in a way that is consistently 
generating cash and delighting our customers.  

Fundamental Demand Drivers 

Sunrun is well positioned to drive meaningful value for shareholders in 2025 and beyond.  The grid 
continues to become less reliable and more expensive, consumers are demanding more energy 
independence and choice, and technology advancements continue to unlock more opportunities.   
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Our primary focus is furthering our differentiation, launching additional products and services to expand 
customer lifetime values, and remaining the disciplined, margin- and customer-focused industry leader, 
growing Cash Generation in the business for years to come.   

I know we are living in uncertain times, and no one can predict the future perfectly.  But what we can do is 
continue building an incredibly resilient and efficient organization that can pivot and respond to whatever is 
thrown at it.  I recall just a few years ago investors were skeptical because Sunrun had negative cash 
generation and was facing large regulatory changes in California, massive increases in interest rates, and 
a challenging supply chain.  Sunrun not only managed to adapt to those pressures, but has now started to 
generate significant cash on a recurring basis – with higher rates, while operating under NEM3, and 
navigating the various supply chain dynamics.  This is the team that knows how to focus on first rate 
execution and lead this industry. 

Supporting our customers and communities 

Before handing it over to Danny, I want to take a moment to share how Sunrun employees responded 
during the devastating Los Angeles wildfires in January.  

As soon as high winds and wildfire threats emerged, our team initiated our planned response to support 
customers and employees.  In an emergency like this, the homes we serve become critical infrastructure in 
impacted communities — supporting both our customers and the communities they live in.  Batteries were 
automatically adjusted to maximize backup power ahead of widespread blackouts.  When I visited our Los 
Angeles teams and customers during that time, I heard numerous stories of how Sunrun customer homes 
provided essential power and a safe haven for so many who were impacted by this tragedy.  

These events highlight the urgent need to more safely generate and deliver energy to customers, and to 
have onsite power generation and storage systems providing critical power during emergencies.  Demand 
for our storage offering remains robust following this event.   

With that, let me turn the call over to Danny for our financial update.  

DANNY ABAJIAN 

Thank you, Mary.  

Today I will cover our operating and financial performance in the quarter along with an update on our 
capital markets activities and outlook.  

Turning first to the results for the quarter on slide 10. 

Volumes 

We have now installed over 156,000 solar and storage systems, with storage attachment rates reaching 
62% of installations during the quarter.  We expect storage attachment rates to remain around this level or 
slightly higher for the next few quarters.  This higher mix of storage continues to drive Net Subscriber 
Values higher.  

During the quarter, we installed 392 megawatt hours of storage capacity, well above the high-end of our 
guidance, and an increase of 78% compared to the same quarter last year. Our total Networked Storage 
Capacity is now above 2.5 gigawatt-hours.   

In the fourth quarter, Solar Energy Capacity Installed was approximately 242 megawatts, within our 
guidance range of 240 to 250 megawatts, and an increase of approximately 7% compared to the prior 
year.  
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Customer Additions were approximately 32,900, including approximately 30,700 Subscriber Additions. Our 
Subscription mix remained at 96% of deployments in the period.  Customer Additions with storage was 
approximately 20,400 in the quarter, an increase of 50% compared to the same quarter last year.  

We ended Q4 with approximately one million Customers and 889,000 Subscribers representing 7.5 
Gigawatts of Networked Solar Energy Capacity, a 13% increase year-over-year. 

Our Subscribers generate significant, recurring revenue, with most under 20- or 25-year contracts for the 
clean energy we provide. At the end of Q4, our Annual Recurring Revenue, or ARR, stood at over $1.6 
billion, up 23% over the same period last year. We had an average contract life remaining of nearly 18 
years.  

Subscriber Value, Creation Cost, Net Subscriber Value & Total Value Generated 

Turning to slide 10.  

In Q4, Subscriber Value was approximately $55,800 and Creation Cost was approximately $36,600, 
delivering a Net Subscriber Value of $19,177.  This strong result was from higher battery attachment rates, 
a higher average Investment Tax Credit level, and sequential growth in volumes leading to improved fixed 
cost absorption.  

Our Q4 Subscriber Value and Net Subscriber Value reflect a blended Investment Tax Credit of 39.8%.  We 
realized stronger-than-expected achievement in the 2024 low- to middle-income ITC adder allocation 
process, which provided an approximate $750 benefit to our reported Subscriber Value in Q4. Qualification 
for the domestic content ITC adder is picking up, although at a slower ramp within our Affiliate Partner 
segment.  Our blended Investment Tax Credit was at approximately 42% for January installations and we 
expect this level to increase further to 45% later in 2025.  

Total Value Generated, which is Net Subscriber Value multiplied by the number of Subscriber Additions in 
the period, was $589 million in the fourth quarter.   

Our present value-based metrics are presented using a 6% discount rate, but our financial underwriting 
already accounts for our current cost of capital, which was approximately 7.3% in Q4.  At a 7.3% discount 
rate, Net Subscriber Value was approximately $14,400 and Total Value Generated was $441 million.  
Excluding the non-contracted portion of Subscriber Value, but still adjusting for a 7.3% discount rate, 
contracted Net Subscriber Value was approximately $11,600 and Total Value Generated was $357 million, 
an increase of 125% compared to the prior year.   

On slide 11 you can see our progress increasing Subscriber Value through higher-value mix and higher 
ITC levels, while keeping creation costs largely flat, generating expanded Net Subscriber Values. Efficiency 
improvements and hardware cost declines, coupled with operating cost leverage from sequential volume 
growth, have largely offset the increased costs associated with higher storage attachment rates.  

Gross and Net Earning Assets 

Turning now to Gross and Net Earning Assets and our balance sheet on slide 13. 

Gross Earning Assets were $17.8 billion at the end of the fourth quarter. Gross Earning Assets is the 
measure of cash flows we expect to receive from Subscribers over time, net of operating and maintenance 
costs, distributions to tax equity partners, and distributions to project equity financing partners, all 
discounted at a 6% unlevered capital cost.   

Net Earnings Assets were $6.8 billion at the end of the fourth quarter, up $536 million from the prior 
quarter.  Net Earning Assets is Gross Earning Assets, plus cash, less all debt.  Net Earning Assets does 
not include inventory, other construction in progress assets or any net derivative assets related to interest 
rate hedges, all of which represent additional value.  The value creation upside we expect from future grid 
service opportunities and selling additional products and services to our customer base are not reflected in 
these metrics.   

In our prudent risk management approach, we programmatically enter into interest rate hedges to insulate 
our capital costs from adverse near-term fluctuations. The vast majority of our debt is either fixed-coupon 
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long-dated securities, or floating-rate loans that have been hedged with interest rate swaps. As such, we 
do not adjust the discount rate used in Net Earning Assets to match current capital costs for new 
installations.  

Capital Markets & Capital Runway 

Turning to our capital markets activities.   
 
Sunrun’s industry-leading performance as an originator and servicer of residential solar assets continues 
to provide deep access to attractively-priced capital.   
 
As of today, closed transactions and executed term sheets provide us with expected tax equity capacity to 
fund over 500 megawatts of projects for Subscribers beyond what was deployed through the fourth 
quarter. Thus far in 2025 we have added more than $1.3 billion in tax equity, resulting in this strong 
runway. 
 
We also have over $680 million in unused commitments available in our non-recourse senior revolving 
warehouse loan after our January securitization. This unused amount would fund approximately 230 
megawatts of projects for Subscribers.  Our strong debt capital runway allows us to be selective in timing 
term-out transactions.   
 
In January we priced the industry’s second largest securitization, behind only our own transaction from 
June of last year.  The oversubscribed transaction was structured with three separate classes of A rated 
notes, only two of which were publicly offered. The weighted average spread of the notes was 197 basis 
points, which was an improvement of approximately 38 basis points from our prior securitization in 
September. Similar to prior transactions, we raised additional subordinated non-recourse debt financing 
which increased the cumulative advance rate, as measured against our Contracted Subscriber Value 
metric, to above 80%.  
 
When we think about our balance sheet, we prioritize a strong cash position and use of asset-level 
non-recourse debt financing.  This strategy provides the lowest cost capital to finance cash-flow producing 
assets backed by highly creditworthy consumers, and is designed to avoid the use of parent capital to fund 
our recurring origination activity.  

Balance Sheet, Cash Generation & Capital Allocation 

Cash Generation was $34 million in Q4, the third consecutive quarter of positive Cash Generation.  

Cash Generation would have been approximately $66 million had it not been for a few factors.  First, we 
decided to invest $18 million in cash for safe harbor equipment purchases in late Q4.  Second, our Affiliate 
Partners experienced a slower ramp in domestic content ITC adder qualification.  These two primary 
factors, along with other minor working capital timing differences, collectively represented over $32 million 
in reductions to Cash Generation for the period. 

During the fourth quarter we executed a safe harbor program to insulate various tax policy risks.  The 
program was executed in a very capital-efficient way, securing $350 million in equipment purchases while 
only consuming about $18 million in net working capital. These purchases provide risk mitigation for 
volumes throughout 2025 for solar projects and midway through 2025 for storage projects.  We will explore 
additional safe harbor initiatives if circumstances warrant in the future, and we intend to maintain 
availability of non-equity capital dedicated for this purpose.  

We have a strong balance sheet with no near-term corporate debt maturities.  We ended the quarter with 
$947 million in Total Cash.   

During the fourth quarter, we repurchased $126 million in principal of our 2026 Convertible Notes at a 
discount.  As of the end of 2024 we had only $8 million in principal outstanding of these notes, which we 
plan to repurchase in 2025. Since March 2024 we have paid down recourse debt by $186 million by 
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repurchasing our 2026 Convertible Notes and reducing borrowings under our recourse Working Capital 
Facility.   

We expect to further pay down $100 million or more in recourse debt in 2025.  Aside from the $8 million 
outstanding of our 2026 Convertible Notes, we have no recourse debt maturities until March 2027.   

We have no parent capital needs at this time.  

Over time we will explore further capital allocation options to maximize shareholder value, based on 
market conditions and long-term outlook. 

Outlook 

Turning now to our financial outlook. 

The underpenetrated nature of our industry gives us confidence we can sustain robust growth throughout 
this decade. In this strong long-term demand backdrop, our priority is to generate cash by continuing to 
increase customer values through growing our mix of higher-value products and by keeping our costs low.  
Our margin-focused growth is yielding strong results and provides a high-growth outlook for aggregate 
value creation, which will translate into Cash Generation and growth in our book value of deployed 
systems, or Net Earning Assets.  

Turning to slides 17 and 18.  

Before I share our specific guidance for Q1 and the full-year 2025, I want to detail a few of the key metrics 
we will report and guide to commencing with our Q1 2025 release that we believe align with our strategy.  

Over a year ago, we started reporting Subscriber Value and Net Subscriber Value pro forma for the market 
cost of capital we observed each period and used to make our financial underwriting decisions. This 
additional disclosure showed our ability to substantially grow unit margins even as capital costs remained 
elevated and fluctuated. Importantly, we also directly addressed critiques about our use of a fixed 6% 
discount rate in the higher capital cost environment. Going forward, we will report Subscriber Value, Net 
Subscriber Value, Total Value Generated, and any similar metrics derived from Subscriber Value, using 
only a floating discount rate that reflects market-observed cost of capital for each period. 

Gross Earning Assets, our book value measure, will continue to use a fixed discount rate.  As I noted, 
because the vast majority of our customer cash flows are not subject to floating rate exposure, adjusting 
the discount rate each quarter is not appropriate. 

Continuing to increase our aggregate value creation correlates with growth in Cash Generation over time.  
Accordingly, we will start guiding to aggregate value creation metrics, while moving away from guiding to 
specific solar and storage deployment volumes and unit margins each period.  We will continue to report 
and provide commentary on deployments and unit margins, including our optimization between the two, so 
that analysts and investors can continue to track the fundamental building blocks in our business.  

On our next call, we will provide guidance on the following primary metrics – first, Aggregate Subscriber 
Value, which is Subscriber Value multiplied by the number of Subscriber Additions in a period; second, 
Contracted Net Value Creation, which is the contracted-only portion of Aggregate Subscriber Value 
conservatively excluding non-contracted value, less aggregate Creation Costs; and third, Cash 
Generation. 

On slides 19 and 20, we detail our guidance. 

Strong value creation will allow us to deliver Cash Generation of $40 to $50 million in Q1, which will be our 
fourth consecutive quarter of positive Cash Generation. 

Underpinning our Q1 Cash Generation guidance, storage installations are expected to grow at a robust 
pace, while solar installations are expected to be approximately flat compared to the prior year – with 
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higher growth in our direct business than our Affiliate Partner business. In Q1, Storage Capacity Installed 
is expected to be in a range of 265 to 275 megawatt hours, and Solar Capacity Installed is expected to be 
in a range of 170 to 180 megawatts.   

For the full year 2025, we expect Cash Generation to be in a range of $200 to $500 million. This is a 
revision from our prior guidance of $350 to $600 million, driven by a slower ramp in Domestic Content ITC 
adders in our Affiliate Partner business, higher capital cost assumptions, and slightly lower volume 
expectations, partially offset by higher storage mix.   

On slide 20, we outline the assumptions and sensitivities related to key variables that would affect our 
achievement of our 2025 outlook.  We expect a 44% weighted average ITC level in 2025, and further 
underpinning our guidance are assumptions of 7.5 to 8 percent average cost of project-level capital, 
battery attachment rates around 66%, and slight improvements to the timing of tax credit transfers as that 
market further matures.  Our Cash Generation outlook does not reflect additional safe harbor equipment 
purchases.  We expect solar install volumes to be approximately flat this year. 

As we achieve Cash Generation, we will continue to allocate excess unrestricted cash to deleverage, with 
a target to pay down parent recourse debt by $100 million or more by the end of 2025. We are committed 
to a capital allocation strategy beyond this initial de-leveraging period that drives significant shareholder 
value.   

With that, let me turn it back to Mary.   

MARY POWELL 

Thanks, Danny.   

I so appreciate the work of the entire Sunrun team.  At our scale, even with more modest growth in new 
additions, we are adding over 100,000 customers a year -- which is double digit growth to our fleet -- and 
with 66% battery attachment rates, that’s well over a gigawatt-hour of valuable storage capacity, or the 
peak capacity of a nuclear plant… on an annual basis.  The strategic shift we undertook nearly two years 
ago to emphasize high-quality growth is yielding strong results in terms of repeatable and meaningful Cash 
Generation along with providing customers with a greater sense of independence, stability and security in 
their own homes.   

Operator, let’s open the line for questions. 

 
***** 

Forward Looking Statements 

This communication contains forward-looking statements related to Sunrun (the “Company”) within the 
meaning of Section 27A of the Securities Act of 1933, and Section 21E of the Securities Exchange Act of 
1934 and the Private Securities Litigation Reform Act of 1995. Such forward-looking statements include, 
but are not limited to, statements related to: the Company’s financial and operating guidance and 
expectations; the Company’s business plan, trajectory, expectations, market leadership, competitive 
advantages, operational and financial results and metrics (and the assumptions related to the calculation 
of such metrics); the Company’s momentum in its business strategies including expectations regarding 
market share, total addressable market, growth in certain geographies, customer value proposition, market 
penetration, growth of certain divisions, financing activities, financing capacity, product mix, and ability to 
manage cash flow and liquidity; the growth of the solar industry; the Company’s financing activities and 
expectations to refinance, amend, and/or extend any financing facilities;  trends or potential trends within 
the solar industry, our business, customer base, and market; the Company’s ability to derive value from the 
anticipated benefits of partnerships, new technologies, and pilot programs, including contract renewal and 
repowering programs; anticipated demand, market acceptance, and market adoption of the Company’s 
offerings, including new products, services, and technologies; the Company’s strategy to be a 
margin-focused, multi-product, customer-oriented company; the ability to increase margins based on a 
shift in product focus; expectations regarding the growth of home electrification, electric vehicles, virtual 
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power plants, and distributed energy resources; the Company’s ability to manage suppliers, inventory, and 
workforce; supply chains and regulatory impacts affecting supply chains; the Company’s leadership team 
and talent development; the legislative and regulatory environment of the solar industry and the potential 
impacts of proposed, amended, and newly adopted legislation and regulation on the solar industry and our 
business; the ongoing expectations regarding the Company’s storage and energy services businesses and 
anticipated emissions reductions due to utilization of the Company’s solar energy systems;  and factors 
outside of the Company’s control such as macroeconomic trends, bank failures, public health 
emergencies, natural disasters, acts of war, terrorism, geopolitical conflict, or armed conflict / invasion, and 
the impacts of climate change. These statements are not guarantees of future performance; they reflect 
the Company’s current views with respect to future events and are based on assumptions and estimates 
and are subject to known and unknown risks, uncertainties and other factors that may cause actual results, 
performance or achievements to be materially different from expectations or results projected or implied by 
forward-looking statements. The risks and uncertainties that could cause the Company’s results to differ 
materially from those expressed or implied by such forward-looking statements include: the Company’s 
continued ability to manage costs and compete effectively; the availability of additional financing on 
acceptable terms; worldwide economic conditions, including slow or negative growth rates and inflation; 
volatile or rising interest rates; changes in policies and regulations, including net metering, interconnection 
limits, and fixed fees, or caps and licensing restrictions and the impact of these changes on the solar 
industry and our business; the Company’s ability to attract and retain the Company’s business partners; 
supply chain risks and associated costs; realizing the anticipated benefits of past or future investments, 
partnerships, strategic transactions, or acquisitions, and integrating those acquisitions; the Company’s 
leadership team and ability to attract and retain key employees; changes in the retail prices of traditional 
utility generated electricity; the availability of rebates, tax credits and other incentives; the availability of 
solar panels, batteries, and other components and raw materials; the Company’s business plan and the 
Company’s ability to effectively manage the Company’s growth and labor constraints; the Company’s 
ability to meet the covenants in the Company’s investment funds and debt facilities; factors impacting the 
home electrification and solar industry generally, and such other risks and uncertainties identified in the 
reports that we file with the U.S. Securities and Exchange Commission from time to time. All 
forward-looking statements used herein are based on information available to us as of the date hereof, and 
we assume no obligation to update publicly these forward-looking statements for any reason, except as 
required by law. 
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