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Cemtrex’s CEO Interview to Air on
Bloomberg International on the RedChip
Money Report
Long Island City, NY, Jan. 16, 2019 (GLOBE NEWSWIRE) --  – Cemtrex Inc. (NASDAQ:
CETX, CETXP, CETXW), a leading global technology and manufacturing company, today
announced its CEO, Saagar Govil, was interviewed on The RedChip Money Report
television program. The interview will air Wednesday, January 16 on Bloomberg
International, available in 149 million homes across Europe, the Middle East, and Africa.
Check local listings for times in your area.

In the interview, Govil provides an update on the Company’s flagship IoT product,
SmartDesk, the world’s most advanced workstation, including near-term sales and delivery
expectations.

To view the interview segment, please visit: https://www.youtube.com/watch?
v=kvdwHApYNMU

“The RedChip Money Report" delivers insightful commentary on small-cap investing,
interviews with Wall Street analysts, financial book reviews, as well as featured interviews
with executives of public companies. The show is hosted by Dave Gentry, a leading authority
on small-cap stocks and the author of Small Stocks, Big Money, published by Wiley Finance.
Gentry has made multiple guest appearances on both CNBC and Fox Business News.

About Cemtrex

Cemtrex, Inc. (NASDAQ: CETX) is a diversified technology company driving innovation in a
wide range of sectors, including smart technology, virtual and augmented realities, advanced
electronic systems, industrial solutions, and intelligent security systems. Cemtrex is the
manufacturer of the SmartDesk, the world’s most advanced workstation. Find Cemtrex on
the web at www.cemtrex.com.

Safe Harbor Statement

This press release contains “forward-looking statements” within the meaning of the Private
Securities Litigation Reform Act of 1995, including statements relating to Cemtrex’s
proposed offering of securities. These forward-looking statements are based on
management’s current expectations and are subject to certain risks and uncertainties,
including those described in Cemtrex’s SEC periodic reports and other filings, that could
cause actual results to differ materially from those set forth in or implied by such forward-
looking statements. Statements made herein are as of the date of this press release and
should not be relied upon as of any subsequent date.
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