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Todd Cravens Joins Galaxy Gaming to
Lead its Business Development
LAS VEGAS, Jan. 03, 2017 (GLOBE NEWSWIRE) -- Galaxy Gaming, Inc. (OTC:GLXZ), the
world’s largest independent developer, manufacturer and distributor of casino table games
and enhanced casino systems, announced today that Mr. Todd Cravens has joined the
Company in the position of Vice President of Business Development.  In that capacity, Mr.
Cravens is responsible for expanding the Company’s business both domestically and in
foreign markets.  The areas of growth targeted not only includes escalating Galaxy’s core
business, but Mr. Cravens will be guiding the Company to provide new cutting-edge
products and services designed to enhance the business operations of Galaxy’s casino
clients.

Mr. Cravens was most recently the CEO of the Americas for TCS John Huxley for the last
three and a half years.  With over 25 years of experience in the amusement and gaming
industries, including executive positions at American Gaming Systems (AGS) and Betson
Enterprises, Mr. Cravens is well respected in the gaming industry for his team-building skills.

“Speaking for the entire Galaxy team, we are delighted to have Todd come on board,” stated
Galaxy’s Chief Executive Officer, Robert Saucier.  “Todd’s skills and experience is ideally
suited to the duties, responsibilities and authorities associated with the newly created
position of VP of Business Development.  In recent years, we had become aware of his solid
reputation amongst casino operators for his listening skills and responding to their needs
and desires.  I have long ago discovered that the best way to judge someone is to talk to the
people they serve.  With that in mind and through inquiries we made with casino operators,
we were compelled to add Todd to Galaxy’s Leadership Team.  We are extremely fortunate
to have someone with Todd’s impressive credentials, expertise and enthusiasm and we look
forward to his future contributions,” added Mr. Saucier.

“I am very excited to join Galaxy Gaming,” commented Mr. Cravens.  “One of the main
reasons that I chose Galaxy is their outstanding reputation amongst casino operators.  It
became clear to me that this company has become a major player in the casino industry. 
Galaxy provides great solutions for casinos that I witnessed are very much appreciated.  In
my new role at Galaxy, my goal is to create even more value for our clients.”

About Galaxy Gaming

Headquartered in Las Vegas, Nevada, Galaxy Gaming (galaxygaming.com) develops,
manufactures and distributes innovative proprietary table games, state-of-the-art electronic
wagering platforms and enhanced bonusing systems to land-based, riverboat, cruise ships
and online casinos worldwide.  Through its iGaming partner Games Marketing Ltd., Galaxy
Gaming licenses its proprietary table games to the online gaming industry.  The Company is
also expanding its global presence through its partnership with WPT Enterprises, Inc., owner
of the World Poker Tour.   Galaxy’s games can be played online at FeelTheRush.com. 
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Connect with Galaxy on Facebook, YouTube and Twitter.

This press release may contain "forward looking" statements within the meaning of the
Securities Act of 1933, as amended, and the Securities Exchange Act of 1934, as amended,
and is subject to the safe harbors created thereby.  Forward looking statements are subject
to change and involve risks and uncertainties that could significantly affect future results,
including those risks detailed from time to time in the Company's filings with the Securities
and Exchange Commission.  Although the Company believes any expectations expressed in
any forward looking statements are reasonable, future results may differ materially from
those expressed in any forward looking statements.  The Company undertakes no obligation
to update the information in this press release except as required by law and represents that
the information speaks only as of today's date.

Robert Saucier, CEO, 702.939.3254
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