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Clearfield to Issue Fiscal Q1 2016 Financial
Results on Thursday, January 28, 2016 at
8:00 a.m. ET
MINNEAPOLIS, Jan. 19, 2016 (GLOBE NEWSWIRE) -- Clearfield, Inc. (NASDAQ:CLFD),
the specialist in fiber management and connectivity platforms for communications providers,
will issue its financial results for the fiscal first quarter ended December 31, 2015.

Clearfield will also issue its FieldReport for the fiscal 2016 first quarter, which will be
available in the investor relations section of the company’s website. Comprised of
presentation slides with audio and video, the report will provide additional insight into the
company’s financial and operational performance.

Investors and analysts are encouraged to submit questions for management to address,
which will be posted on the FieldReport webpage. Please submit your questions to
CLFD@liolios.com.

About Clearfield
Clearfield, Inc. (NASDAQ:CLFD) designs, manufactures and distributes fiber optic
management products for the communications networks of leading ILECS, CLECs,
MSO/cable TV companies and mobile broadband providers. The company helps service
providers solve the Fiber Puzzle, which is how to reduce high costs associated with
deploying, managing, protecting and scaling a fiber optic network to deliver the mobile,
residential and business services customers want. Based on the patented Clearview™
Cassette, the Clearfield’s unique single-architected, modular fiber management platform is
designed to lower the cost of broadband deployment and maintenance by consolidating,
protecting and distributing incoming and outgoing fiber circuits and enabling its customers to
scale their operations as their subscriber revenues increase. Headquartered in Minneapolis,
MN, Clearfield deploys more than a million fiber ports each year. For more information, visit
www.seeclearfield.com.
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