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Eve Air Mobility and Signature Aviation
Partner to Research Ecosystem
Requirements and Services for Advanced
Air Mobility Ground Operations

Agreement includes exploration of necessary requirements for safe, scalable ground
operations for AAM, along with intent to integrate Vector, Eve’s urban traffic air management

software.

MELBOURNE, Fla. – Dec. 11, 2024 - Eve Air Mobility (NYSE: EVEX; EVEXW), a global
leader in manufacturing and providing services for electric vertical take-off and landing
(eVTOL) aircraft, and Signature Aviation, the world’s largest network of private aviation
terminals, have signed a Memorandum of Understanding (MoU) to research ecosystem
requirements as well as the ground services necessary for safe, efficient and scalable
Advanced Air Mobility (AAM) ground operations. 

"Following the rollout of our first full-scale eVTOL prototype, we continue to build on that
momentum and are looking forward to teaming with Signature Aviation to support eVTOL
operations," said Luiz Mauad, vice president, Services, Operations Solutions, Strategic
Design & Ecosystem at Eve Air Mobility. "Eve and Signature will leverage the companies’
combined global presence and experience in servicing aircraft and creating seamless
passenger experiences. Signature Aviation’s insight into ground services needs, local
knowledge, private aviation terminal operations and passenger services will inform the
procedures and ecosystem needed to accelerate preparations for eVTOLs to launch and
scale.”

The agreement brings together two seasoned, major players in the global aerospace
industry: Eve Air Mobility’s expertise as an eVTOL manufacturer and Signature Aviation’s
global network of private aviation terminals. As part of the MoU, the two companies will also
explore potential future commercial partnerships.

“The announcement of our partnership with Eve adds to a transformative year for Signature,
while also reinforcing our commitment to shaping the future of aviation through our
sustainability initiatives,” said Derek DeCross, chief commercial officer, Signature Aviation.
“We’re always looking ahead to create and deliver exceptional experiences for our guests,
and working towards the most comprehensive ground infrastructure for eVTOL aircraft is a
major part of that mission. This collaboration will bring together our experience, resources,
and creativity to find the most effective path towards innovative, safe, and scalable ground
operations for advanced air mobility.” 

In addition to the MoU, the two companies have signed a Letter of Intent (LOI) for Vector,



Eve’s urban air traffic management software. Vector is an agnostic software solution
designed to safely address the unique air traffic and network management challenges of
current and future AAM operations. Vector will support reliable, efficient and scalable fleet
and vertiport operations, enabling operators to adapt as the industry grows. The company is
advancing towards an operational version of the software which customers can now test and
trial to help progress the market. 

Eve recently announced the launch of its fully integrated aftermarket services portfolio for
efficient and safe urban air mobility operations. Eve TechCare is a pioneer all-in-one suite of
solutions designed to streamline eVTOL operations by providing the industry’s most
comprehensive services, expert customer support, and cutting-edge operational solutions.
Backed by Embraer’s 55 years of history and aerospace industry expertise, Eve TechCare
offers a unique way of serving customers with a global footprint and local presence. The
aftermarket portfolio consists of technical support and solutions, MRO services, parts and
battery solutions, as well as training services and flight operation solutions, which operators
will access through a digital platform. Eve TechCare’s service and support solutions will
cover all the operational aspects necessary to ensure the daily eVTOL operation.

With letters of intent for 2,900 eVTOLs, Eve’s aircraft utilizes eight dedicated propellers for
vertical flight and fixed wings to fly in cruise, with no change in the position of these
components during flight. The concept includes an electric pusher powered by dual electric
motors that provide propulsion redundancy with the goal of ensuring the highest levels of
performance, safety and dispatch reliability and low cost of operation.
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About Eve

About Signature Aviation

Signature Aviation is the world’s preeminent aviation hospitality company, offering
exceptional experiences and essential support services to business and private aviation
guests. The company’s large-scale infrastructure footprint enables travel, fosters human
connection and is a critical global economic driver. Signature operates an industry-leading
network of private aviation terminals, with over 200 locations covering key destinations in 27
countries across five continents and is the largest distributor of sustainable aviation fuel
(SAF) in business aviation. The company also offers over 16 million square feet of carbon
neutral multiuse office and hangar real estate globally, providing unique networkwide
benefits and advantages to guests who base their aircraft at a Signature location. For more
information, please visit www.signatureaviation.com.

Contacts:

Eve: media@eveairmobility.com

Signature: jeff.penson@signatureaviation.com
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Certain statements contained in this release are forward-looking statements within the
meaning of the Private Securities Litigation Reform Act of 1995. These forward-looking
statements may be identified by words such as “may,” “will,” “expect,” “intend,” “anticipate,”
“believe,” “estimate,” “plan,” “project,” “could,” “should,” “would,” “continue,” “seek,” “target,”
“guidance,” “outlook,” “if current trends continue,” “optimistic,” “forecast” and other similar
words or expressions. All statements, other than statements of historical facts, are forward-
looking statements, including, but not limited to, statements about the company’s plans,
objectives, expectations, outlooks, projections, intentions, estimates, and other statements of
future events or conditions, including with respect to all companies or entities named within.
These forward-looking statements are based on the company’s current objectives, beliefs
and expectations, and they are subject to significant risks and uncertainties that may cause
actual results and financial position and timing of certain events to differ materially from the
information in the forward-looking statements. These risks and uncertainties include, but are
not limited to, those set forth herein as well as in Part I, Item 1A. Risk Factors and Part II,
Item 7. Management’s Discussion and Analysis of Financial Condition and Results of
Operations of the company’s most recent Annual Report on Form 10-K, Part I, Item 2.
Management’s Discussion and Analysis of Financial Condition and Results of Operations
and Part II, Item 1A. Risk Factors of the company’s most recent Quarterly Report on Form
10-Q, and other risks and uncertainties listed from time to time in the company’s other filings
with the Securities and Exchange Commission. Additionally, there may be other factors of
which the company is not currently aware that may affect matters discussed in the forward-
looking statements and may also cause actual results to differ materially from those
discussed. The company does not assume any obligation to publicly update or supplement
any forward-looking statement to reflect actual results, changes in assumptions or changes
in other factors affecting these forward-looking statements. other than as required by law.
Any forward-looking statements speak only as of the date hereof or as of the dates indicated
in the statement.
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