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Legendary Golf Instructor Jim McLean
Joins SiriusXM PGA TOUR Radio
Owner of the Jim McLean Golf Schools will host a twice-a-week call-in
show alongside fellow top teacher Jeff Warne, starting in 2014

Will share swing tips and instruction with listeners nationwide

NEW YORK, Nov. 19, 2013 /PRNewswire/ -- SiriusXM announced today that Jim McLean,
one of the country's leading golf instructors, has joined the roster of hosts on SiriusXM PGA
TOUR Radio (channel 93 on XM, channel 208 on Sirius Premier).

(Logo: https://photos.prnewswire.com/prnh/20101014/NY82093LOGO )

Starting in 2014 McLean, owner of the world renowned Jim McLean Golf Schools, will join
fellow PGA professional Jeff Warne to host Serious Golf, a call-in show airing twice a week
and dedicated to providing swing tips and instruction for listeners nationwide.  Golfers at any
level of the game, from those who are just picking up the game to seasoned players looking
to hone their skills, are encouraged to dial in to the show for tutoring and advice.  An
announcement with more details, including the show's launch date and airtimes, will be
made in the coming weeks.

"I'm very excited to join SiriusXM PGA TOUR Radio to do a show featuring golf instruction,"
said McLean.  "My livelihood is based solely on teaching the game of golf.  I teach golf to
beginners and the best players in the world at my golf schools, and I love to talk about every
aspect of instruction."

"Jim and Jeff have dedicated their careers to helping golfers lower their scores and enjoy
the game more and we are thrilled to have them contribute their expertise to SiriusXM PGA
TOUR Radio," said Scott Greenstein, SiriusXM's President and Chief Content Officer.  "They
have a tremendous knack for communicating the nuances of the swing and golf in general to
their students.  This show will appeal to players at all levels of the game by giving them
access to two of the top teachers in America."

Jim McLean owns and operates the top golf schools worldwide, 10 in total. The Jim McLean
Golf Schools world headquarters is located at the famous Trump National Doral in Miami,
FL, where Jim oversees an operation that includes 24 teachers and six PGA assistants.  Jim
has been ranked as one of the top three teachers in America for two decades and has
taught some of the greatest players on both the PGA TOUR and LPGA tour. This includes
players like Tom Kite, Hal Sutton, Keegan Bradley, Bernard Langer, Erik Compton, Brad
Faxon, Dana Quigley, Lenny Mattiace, plus #1 ranked Cristie Kerr, and current LPGA
sensation Lexi Thompson. 

McLean has been a teacher to golf professionals worldwide and is regarded as one of the
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very top golf swing researchers in the game.  He has been a PGA Master Professional since
1990 and has led more than 50 national teaching workshops for the PGA.  Jim has authored
11 top selling golf instruction books, produced over 20 DVDs, and writes full time for Golf
Digest magazine. His Eight Step Golf DVD is the all time #1 selling DVD on the Golf
Channel.  Jim worked at the Golf Channel for 10 years and did the first reality show on that
channel, Breaking 100.  His DVD Ben Hogan:The Golf Swing won six major national awards.
Jim wrote three cover piece articles in Golf Magazine for The X Factor, wrote The X Factor
book, produced The X Factor DVD, and did a 10-part X Factor golf show series for the Golf
Channel. His X Factor research has been used in golf biomechanics around the globe. 

Jim has competed on the PGA TOUR, played in the U.S. Open, the U.S. Senior Open, the
U.S. Amateur and the U.S. Junior Amateur, and also competed in the Masters, where he
made the cut.  He was an All-American at the University of Houston and has won more than
50 Junior and Amateur titles. 

Jeff Warne is the Director of Golf at The Bridge, located in Bridgehampton, New York, on
Long Island's prestigious East End.  He previously was Jim McLean's Director of Instruction
at Sleepy Hollow CC in New York, as well as a Lead Instructor at McLean's school at Doral. 
Prior to coming to The Bridge, Jeff was the Director of Instruction at The Atlantic Golf Club,
and was named to GOLF Magazine's inaugural Top 100 Teachers list.   The 2013 Long
Island Senior Open Champion, he competes regularly in the MET Section of the PGA, which
is widely regarded as the most competitive PGA playing section in the country.  In addition to
his teaching abilities, Jeff has a passion for great golf courses and golf architecture, and has
played more than 120 of the great courses of the UK and Ireland, and has a wealth of
information not just on the shots that are required to play these courses, but also on which
ones to play and why.

Launched in 2005, SiriusXM PGA TOUR Radio offers listeners nationwide live play-by-play
coverage of PGA TOUR events as well as major championship tournaments, plus live call-in
talk shows offering news, analysis, equipment reviews and more. 

About SiriusXM

Sirius XM Holdings Inc. (NASDAQ: SIRI) is the world's largest radio broadcaster measured
by revenue and has 25.6 million subscribers.  SiriusXM creates and broadcasts commercial-
free music; premier sports talk and live events; comedy; news; exclusive talk and
entertainment; and the most comprehensive Latin music, sports and talk programming in
radio. SiriusXM is available in vehicles from every major car company in the U.S. and from
retailers nationwide as well as at shop.siriusxm.com. SiriusXM programming is available
through the SiriusXM Internet Radio App for smartphones and other connected devices as
well as online at siriusxm.com. SiriusXM also provides premium traffic, weather, data and
information services for subscribers in cars, trucks, RVs, boats and aircraft through SiriusXM
Traffic™, SiriusXM Travel Link, NavTraffic®, NavWeather™, SiriusXM Aviation, SiriusXM
Marine™, Sirius Marine Weather, XMWX Aviation™, and XMWX Marine™.  SiriusXM holds
a minority interest in SiriusXM Canada which has more than 2 million subscribers.

On social media, join the SiriusXM community on Facebook, Twitter, Instagram, and
YouTube.
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This communication contains "forward-looking statements" within the meaning of the Private
Securities Litigation Reform Act of 1995.  Such statements include, but are not limited to,
statements about future financial and operating results, our plans, objectives, expectations
and intentions with respect to future operations, products and services; and other
statements identified by words such as "will likely result," "are expected to," "will continue,"
"is anticipated," "estimated," "believe," "intend," "plan," "projection," "outlook" or words of
similar meaning.  Such forward-looking statements are based upon the current beliefs and
expectations of our management and are inherently subject to significant business,
economic and competitive uncertainties and contingencies, many of which are difficult to
predict and generally beyond our control.  Actual results may differ materially from the
results anticipated in these forward-looking statements. 

The following factors, among others, could cause actual results to differ materially from the
anticipated results or other expectations expressed in the forward-looking statements: our
competitive position versus other forms of radio and  audio services; our dependence upon
automakers; general economic conditions; failure of our satellites, which, in most cases, are
not insured; our ability to attract and retain subscribers at a profitable level; royalties we pay
for music rights; the unfavorable outcome of pending or future litigation; rapid technological
and industry change; failure of third parties to perform; changes in consumer protection laws
and their enforcement; and our substantial indebtedness.  Additional factors that could
cause our results to differ materially from those described in the forward-looking statements
can be found in our Annual Report on Form 10-K for the year ended December 31, 2012,
which is filed with the Securities and Exchange Commission (the "SEC") and available at the
SEC's Internet site (http://www.sec.gov).  The information set forth herein speaks only as of
the date hereof, and we disclaim any intention or obligation to update any forward looking
statements as a result of developments occurring after the date of this communication.
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Media contact:
Andrew FitzPatrick, SiriusXM, 212-901-6693, andrew.fitzpatrick@siriusxm.com
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