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Chris Stapleton to Headline Exclusive
SiriusXM and Pandora Concert Event in
New Orleans

Stapleton will take the stage on February 6 at The Fillmore to kick off the Big Game
weekend

Full performance will air on SiriusXM’s Chris Stapleton Radio, an exclusive channel
curated and presented by the 10-time GRAMMY winner

NEW YORK – December 12, 2024 – SiriusXM today announced that 10-time GRAMMY
award winning singer, songwriter and musician Chris Stapleton will kick off football’s biggest
weekend with an exclusive concert for SiriusXM and Pandora on Thursday, February 6 at
The Fillmore in New Orleans.

SiriusXM and Pandora Present Chris Stapleton will feature the country superstar performing
songs from across his acclaimed catalogue, including his latest album, the Grammy-
nominated Higher. 

The special concert will be open to SiriusXM subscribers and Pandora listeners. Fans can
RSVP to attend the in-person show HERE.

https://siriusxmpandorapresentchrisstapleton.splashthat.com/pr


The performance will air in its entirety on SiriusXM’s Chris Stapleton Radio (ch. 63), an
exclusive channel curated and presented by Stapleton and his band. Pandora listeners can
access the Chris Stapleton Radio station HERE. 

The Big Game weekend kick off concert will feature several special elements courtesy of this
year's lineup of brand sponsors including The Glad Products Company, Hilton, LinkedIn Ads,
Mint Mobile, USAA and White Claw. From premium viewing lounges to surprise and delight
moments, these sponsors will help give fans an experience they'll never forget.

SiriusXM’s Chris Stapleton Radio is available to subscribers nationwide in their cars on
channel 63 and anytime on the SiriusXM app. Eligible customers can get their first three
months of SiriusXM streaming for free. Click here to sign up and experience all that SiriusXM
has to offer. See Offer Details.

###

About Chris Stapleton

Kentucky-born Chris Stapleton is a 10x Grammy, 19x CMA and 19x ACM Award-winner and
one of the country’s most respected and beloved musicians. In the midst of yet another
triumphant year, Stapleton won three awards at this year’s CMA Awards, tying the record for
most CMA wins ever, while also extending his own record for most wins in the Male Vocalist
of the Year category (eight). The accolades follow the release of Stapleton’s widely
acclaimed album, Higher (Mercury Nashville). Produced by Dave Cobb, Morgane Stapleton
and Chris Stapleton, the record landed on several “Best of” lists including Billboard, Esquire,
Vulture and Rolling Stone, who praised, “dazzling…the best evidence yet for the way one
man’s voice has become synonymous with the very idea of a musical genre." Additionally,
GQ declared, “In an age rife with division, he’s maybe the only thing Americans all agree
on…one of the most reliable hit makers in music," while NPR Music proclaimed, “Higher puts
him where he always really was—in that classic kind of rock and soul, Tom Petty, Eagles,
going beyond the confines of the genre.”

 Stapleton has also recently collaborated with artists such as Post Malone (“California
Sober”), Dua Lipa (“Think I’m In Love With You (Live from the 59th ACM Awards)”), Slash
(“Oh Well”) and George Strait (“Honky Tonk Hall of Fame”), released a version of Tom
Petty’s “I Should Have Known It” for the new Tom Petty tribute album and returned to NBC’s
“Saturday Night Live” for the third time as musical guest. Known for his electric live
performances, Stapleton will continue his "All-American Road Show" tour through next year
including sold-out shows across Europe and Australia. Additionally, Stapleton and his wife,
Morgane, are founders of the Outlaw State of Kind charitable fund, which supports a variety
of causes that are close to their hearts, while Stapleton also recently unveiled his new
Traveller Whiskey, created in partnership with Buffalo Trace Distillery’s Master Distiller
Harlen Wheatley.

About Sirius XM Holdings Inc.

SiriusXM is the leading audio entertainment company in North America with a portfolio of
audio businesses including its flagship subscription entertainment service SiriusXM; the ad-
supported and premium music streaming services of Pandora; an expansive podcast
network; and a suite of business and advertising solutions. Reaching a combined monthly

https://sxm.app.link/ChrisStapletonRadioPR
https://www.pandora.com/station/play/163116950174572424
https://care.siriusxm.com/subscribe/checkout/purchase/streaming/self-pay/organic?intcmp=Global%20Nav_NA_www:plans_FreeTrialOntheSXMApp&promocode=TA3MOFREE


audience of approximately 150 million listeners, SiriusXM offers a broad range of content for
listeners everywhere they tune in with a diverse mix of live, on-demand, and curated
programming across music, talk, news, and sports. For more about SiriusXM, please go to:
www.siriusxm.com.
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