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Airgain Appoints Anil Doradla as Chief
Financial Officer
Appointment of seasoned financial and operations executive reflects Airgain’s commitment

to continued growth

SAN DIEGO--(BUSINESS WIRE)-- Airgain, Inc. (NASDAQ: AIRG), a leading provider of
advanced antenna technologies used to enable high performance wireless networking, today
announced the appointment of Anil Doradla as Chief Financial Officer.

“I am pleased to welcome Anil to Airgain as the Chief Financial Officer. Anil brings to the role
a unique combination of financial and industry experience that will be vital in executing our
long-term growth strategy. I believe Anil is a great fit for our organization and I am confident
of his ability to contribute substantially as we enter the next stage of growth in our business,”
said Chuck Myers, President and CEO of Airgain.

“I am honoured to succeed Leo and look forward to working with the entire Airgain team. I’ve
seen the rising demand for performance-driven wireless systems place new emphasis on
antenna complexity with Airgain establishing itself as a leading player,” said Doradla. “This is
a very exciting time to be joining the company and I strongly believe there are significant
opportunities ahead of us.”

Doradla joins Airgain with over 20 years of experience in the finance and technology
industry. Prior to Airgain, Doradla served as an Equity Research Analyst at William Blair &
Company where he covered a variety of companies in the technology space. He also
previously worked with the equity research groups at Deutsche Bank and Caris & Company.
Prior to working on Wall Street, he held a variety of strategic and engineering roles at SBC
Labs and LCC International, Inc.

Doradla holds a Master of Science in Electrical Engineering from Virginia Tech and a Master
of Business Administration from the McCombs School of Business at the University of Texas
at Austin.

Doradla will succeed Leo Johnson, who will remain at Airgain as principal financial officer
and principal accounting officer, through the filing of our Annual Report on Form 10-K, on or
before March 30, 2018. Leo will continue in an advisory role and work with Doradla to ensure
a seamless transition.

About Airgain

Airgain Inc. (NASDAQ: AIRG) is a leading provider of advanced antenna technologies used
to enable high performance wireless networking across a broad range of home, enterprise,
and industrial devices. Our innovative antenna systems open up exciting new possibilities in
wireless services requiring high speed throughput, broad coverage footprint, and carrier

http://airgain.com/
http://investors.airgain.com/


grade quality. Our antennas are found in devices deployed in carrier, enterprise, and
residential wireless networks and systems, including set-top boxes, access points, routers,
gateways, media adapters, digital televisions, and Internet of Things{IoT} devices. Airgain
partners with and supplies the largest blue chip brands in the world, including original
equipment and design manufacturers, chipset makers, and global operators. Airgain is
headquartered in San Diego, California, and maintains design and test centers in San Diego,
California; Scottsdale, Arizona; Cambridge, United Kingdom; and, Suzhou and Shenzhen,
China. For more information, visit airgain.com, or follow us on LinkedIn and Twitter.

Airgain and the Airgain logo are registered trademarks of Airgain, Inc.
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