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Boardwalktech Closes $1.2 Million Non-
Brokered Private Placement

Debt Holder and Management also participate in Investment to boost continued growth

CUPERTINO, CA, Nov. 28, 2019 /CNW/ - (TSXV:BWLK;  OTCQB: BWLKF) –
Boardwalktech Software Corp. ("Boardwalktech"), a leading digital ledger platform and
enterprise software solutions company, is pleased to report that it has closed a non-brokered
private placement of units (each, a "Unit") at a price of C$0.45 per Unit, for gross proceeds
of C$1,150,015 (the "Offering") or approximately US$868,900, for a total issuance of
2,555,588 Units. Each Unit is comprised of one common share of the Company and one half
one common share purchase warrant of the Company. Each whole warrant is exercisable at
a price of C$0.65 per share for a period of 24 months following the closing and will be
subject to early redemption by the Company if the trading price of the common shares of the
Company on the TSX Venture Exchange is greater than C$1.00 for 10 consecutive trading
days. The Company paid aggregate finders' fees of C$22,263 and issued 49,250 finders'
options with a term of 2 years and an exercise price of $0.45 to compensate finders who
introduced purchasers under the Offering.

The Company intends to use the proceeds from the Offering for general corporate purposes
plus the expansion and support of their sales and marketing initiatives. Andrew T. Duncan,
Chief Executive Officer and Charles Glavin, Chief Financial Officer subscribed for an
aggregate of 100,000 Units under the Offering for aggregate cash consideration of
C$45,000. The participation of Mr. Duncan and Mr. Glavin in the Offering constitutes related
party transactions under Canadian Multilateral Instrument 61-101 ("MI 61-101") but are
otherwise exempt from the formal valuation and minority approval requirements of MI 61-
101.

As a result of its participation in this equity financing, SQN Venture Partners LLP ("SQN"),
the Company's primary debt holder, will become an insider of the Company as a ten percent
shareholder.

The securities issued under the Offering will be subject to a four-month hold period in
accordance with applicable securities legislation. The Offering is subject to TSX Venture
Exchange final approval.

"This additional working capital will bolster continued sales and marketing efforts as we
focus on closing additional new customer agreements, and grow our pipeline as we
approach our goal achieving positive EBITDA by fiscal year-end.  We are very pleased to
have our primary lender, SQN Ventures, continue their support with a direct equity
investment in this round." stated Andrew T. Duncan, President of Boardwalktech, "Since
implementation of the Company's first direct sales force in the Summer of 2018, the
Company has experienced over a 80% year-over-year increase in billings, which reflects
strong market response to our Enterprise Digital Ledger Platform and the recognition we are



delivering higher ROI to some of the largest companies in the world. With today's financing,
this should help accelerate the closing of new contracts in our pipeline while providing
premium support to existing enterprise customers."  The Company will also release its Fiscal
Q2-2020 Earnings on November 28, 2019.

This news release does not constitute an offer to sell, or a solicitation of an offer to buy, any
of the securities in the United States. The securities have not been and will not be registered
under the United States Securities Act of 1933, as amended (the "U.S. Securities Act") or
any state securities laws and may not be offered or sold within the United States or to U.S.
Persons unless registered under the U.S. Securities Act and applicable state securities laws
or an exemption from such registration is available.

About Boardwalktech Software Corp.

Boardwalktech has developed a patented Digital Ledger Technology Platform that is in use
today by 26 of the Fortune 500 running over 100 live mission critical applications world-wide.
This enterprise platform allows for multi-party collaboration, provenance, verification and
immutable transactions on a trusted, shared, and secured private permissioned blockchain
cloud service. The Boardwalktech platform allows rapid blockchain application development
on any device or user interface, supporting both on/off-chain "smart contract" business logic
and full integration with enterprise systems of record. 

Boardwalktech is headquartered in Cupertino, California with offices in India and operations
in North America. For more information on Boardwalktech, visit our website
at www.boardwalktech.com.

Forward-Looking Information and Statements

This press release contains certain "forward-looking information" within the meaning of
applicable Canadian securities legislation and may also contain statements that may
constitute "forward-looking statements" within the meaning of the safe harbor provisions of
the U.S. Private Securities Litigation Reform Act of 1995. Such forward-looking information
and statements are not representative of historical facts or information or current condition,
but instead represent only the Company's beliefs regarding future events, plans or
objectives, many of which, by their nature, are inherently uncertain and outside of the
Company's control. Generally, such forward-looking information or statements can be
identified by the use of forward-looking terminology such as "plans", "expects" or "does not
expect", "is expected", "budget", "scheduled", "estimates", "forecasts", "intends",
"anticipates" or "does not anticipate", or "believes", or variations of such words and phrases
or may contain statements that certain actions, events or results "may", "could", "would",
"might" or "will be taken", "will continue", "will occur" or "will be achieved". The forward-
looking information contained herein may include, but is not limited to, information
concerning the Offering (including the completion of any additional tranches of the Offering)
and the use of the proceeds raised under the Offering.

By identifying such information and statements in this manner, the Company is alerting the
reader that such information and statements are subject to known and unknown risks,
uncertainties and other factors that may cause the actual results, level of activity,
performance or achievements of the Company to be materially different from those
expressed or implied by such information and statements.

https://c212.net/c/link/?t=0&l=en&o=2656367-1&h=2337499748&u=http%253A%252F%252Fwww.boardwalktech.com%252F&a=www.boardwalktech.com


An investment in securities of the Company is speculative and subject to several risks
including, without limitation, the risks discussed under the heading "Risk Factors" in the
Company's filing statement dated May 30, 2018. Although the Company has attempted to
identify important factors that could cause actual results to differ materially from those
contained in the forward-looking information and forward-looking statements, there may be
other factors that cause results not to be as anticipated, estimated or intended.

In connection with the forward-looking information and forward-looking statements contained
in this press release, the Company has made certain assumptions. Although the Company
believes that the assumptions and factors used in preparing, and the expectations contained
in, the forward-looking information and statements are reasonable, undue reliance should
not be placed on such information and statements, and no assurance or guarantee can be
given that such forward-looking information and statements will prove to be accurate, as
actual results and future events could differ materially from those anticipated in such
information and statements. The forward-looking information and forward-looking statements
contained in this press release are made as of the date of this press release, and the
Company does not undertake to update any forward-looking information and/or forward-
looking statements that are contained or referenced herein, except in accordance with
applicable securities laws. All subsequent written and oral forward- looking information and
statements attributable to the Company or persons acting on its behalf is expressly qualified
in its entirety by this notice.

Neither TSX Venture Exchange nor its Regulation Services Provider (as that term is defined
in the policies of the TSX Venture Exchange) accepts responsibility for the adequacy or
accuracy of this release.
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