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ToughBuilt Announces Financing with
Institutional Investor
LAKE FOREST, Calif., Aug. 19, 2019 (GLOBE NEWSWIRE) -- ToughBuilt Industries, Inc.
(“ToughBuilt”) (NASDAQ: TBLT; TBLTW), a leading designer, manufacturer and
distributor of innovative tools and accessories for the building industry, today announced a
financing agreement with an institutional investor.

On August 19, 2019, the Company entered into a Securities Purchase Agreement with an
institutional investor pursuant to which it sold $11.5 million aggregate principal amount of two
promissory notes (at an aggregate original issue discount of 15%) to the investor in a
transaction exempt from registration under Section 4(a)(2) of the Securities Act of 1933, as
amended.  The first note (the “Series A Note”) has a face amount of $6.72 million for which
the investor paid $5 million in cash.  The second note (the “Series B Note” and with the
Series A Note, collectively referred to as the “Notes”) has a principal amount of $4.78 million
for which the investor paid $4.78 million in the form of a full recourse promissory note issued
by the investor to the Company (the “Investor Note”) secured by $4.78 million in cash or
cash equivalents of the investor (i.e., an original issue discount of approximately 15% to the
face amount of the Series B Note).  No portion of the Series B Note may be converted into
shares of our common stock (the “Common Stock”) until the corresponding portion of the
Investor Note has been paid to the Company in cash, at which point in time such portion of
the Series B Note shall be deemed “unrestricted”.  The Investor Note is subject to
prepayment at any time at the option of the investor and mandatory prepayment, at the
Company’s option, subject to certain equity conditions, at any time 45 trading days after the
effectiveness of a resale registration statement (or otherwise the applicability of Rule 144
promulgated under the Securities Act of 1933, as amended).  Notwithstanding the foregoing,
the Company may not effect a mandatory prepayment if the shares underlying the Series A
Note and the portion of the Series B Note that has become unrestricted exceeds 35% of the
market capitalization of the Company.

The Notes are senior secured obligations of the Company secured by a lien on all assets of
the Company, bear no interest (unless an event default has occurred and is continuing) and
mature on December 31, 2020.  The Notes will be convertible at $1.00 into a fixed number of
shares (the “Conversion Shares”).  The Notes are convertible at the Holder’s option, in
whole or in part, at any time after closing. The Conversion Price will be subject to adjustment
for stock dividends, stock splits, anti-dilution and other customary adjustment events.

In connection with the granting of the Notes, the Company shall issue detachable warrants
to the Investor, exercisable in whole or in part at any time during the five years from the date
of issuance, in an amount equal to 50% of the conversion shares underlying the Notes and
having an exercise price of $1.00 per share.  To the extent the Company has a change of
control or a spinoff, the warrants provide for a put for the warrants to the Company at their
Black- Scholes valuation.



Maxim Group LLC acted as lead placement agent on the offering, and Joseph Gunnar acted
as co-placement agent.

About ToughBuilt Industries, Inc.

ToughBuilt is a groundbreaking designer, manufacturer and distributor of innovative tools
and accessories to the building industry. We market and distribute various home
improvement and construction product lines for both the do-it-yourself and professional
markets under the TOUGHBUILT® brand name, within the global multibillion dollar per year
tool market industry. All of our products are designed by our in-house design team. Since
launching product sales in 2013, we have experienced significant annual sales growth.  Our
current product line includes three major categories, with several additional categories in
various stages of development, consisting of Soft Goods & Kneepads and Sawhorses &
Work Products. Our mission is to provide products to the building and home improvement
communities that are innovative, of superior quality derived in part from enlightened
creativity for our end users while enhancing performance, improving well-being and building
high brand loyalty.  Additional information about the Company is available
at: https://www.toughbuilt.com .

Forward-Looking Statements

This press release contains “forward-looking statements.” Such statements may be
preceded by the words “intends,” “may,” “will,” “plans,” “expects,” “anticipates,” “projects,”
“predicts,” “estimates,” “aims,” “believes,” “hopes,” “potential” or similar words. Forward-
looking statements are not guarantees of future performance, are based on certain
assumptions and are subject to various known and unknown risks and uncertainties, many
of which are beyond the Company’s control, and cannot be predicted or quantified and
consequently, actual results may differ materially from those expressed or implied by such
forward-looking statements. Such risks and uncertainties include, without limitation, risks and
uncertainties associated with (i) market acceptance of our existing and new products, (ii)
negative clinical trial results or lengthy product delays in key markets, (iii) an inability to
secure regulatory approvals for the sale of our products, (iv) intense competition in the
medical device industry from much larger, multinational companies, (v) product liability
claims, (vi) product malfunctions, (vii) our limited manufacturing capabilities and reliance on
subcontractors for assistance, (viii) insufficient or inadequate reimbursement by
governmental and other third party payers for our products, (ix) our efforts to successfully
obtain and maintain intellectual property protection covering our products, which may not be
successful, (x) legislative or regulatory reform of the healthcare system in both the U.S. and
foreign jurisdictions, (xi) our reliance on single suppliers for certain product components, (xii)
the fact that we will need to raise additional capital to meet our business requirements in the
future and that such capital raising may be costly, dilutive or difficult to obtain and (xiii) the
fact that we conduct business in multiple foreign jurisdictions, exposing us to foreign
currency exchange rate fluctuations, logistical and communications challenges, burdens and
costs of compliance with foreign laws and political and economic instability in each
jurisdiction. More detailed information about the Company and the risk factors that may
affect the realization of forward looking statements is set forth in the Company’s filings with
the Securities and Exchange Commission (SEC), including the Company’s Annual Report on
Form 10-K and its Quarterly Reports on Form 10-Q. Investors and security holders are urged
to read these documents free of charge on the SEC’s web site at http://www.sec.gov. The

https://www.globenewswire.com/Tracker?data=8Fd5f_FdUZUxwneMxMb3XX6jrKzXFbrV2-f1i4Op5m9HYRg6gZ7W2dASWx1thMHSwwD4TDx5UYp2aIHtvke5Sx9WPc81Y6_pOdWT9PaBNqo=


Company assumes no obligation to publicly update or revise its forward-looking statements
as a result of new information, future events or otherwise.
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