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Paychex Launches Online Mobile
Application For iPad®

Secure, easy-to-use tablet app expands Software as a Service capabilities, offers users
access to full suite of online payroll, HR, and benefits products through single account sign-

on

ROCHESTER, N.Y.--(BUSINESS WIRE)-- Paychex, Inc., a leading provider of payroll,
human resource, and benefits outsourcing solutions for small- to medium-sized businesses,
today announced an expansion of its Software as a Service (SaaS) product offerings for
clients with the launch of the Paychex Online Mobile application for the Apple® iPad®. The
free, secure, and easy-to-use app includes a newly unveiled and enhanced landing page
and message center. Employers and their employees sign in once to access the full suite of
Paychex online payroll, human resources, and benefits products.

“The Paychex Online Mobile app is the latest example of our commitment to investing in the
next generation of technology and products, and delivering them to our clients,” said
Paychex president and CEO Martin Mucci. “America’s businesses increasingly want access
when, where, and how it works for them. Our tablet app offers that by giving our clients and
their employees complete access to every online product they now use on their PC or
laptop, not a scaled-down version.”

Using the Paychex Online Mobile app for the iPad, Paychex Online clients have full access
to products including online payroll, online reports, Paychex Time and Labor Online, 401(k),
and health insurance. Additionally, the iPad app gives employees of Paychex clients the
unique ability to access and make changes to their 401(k) and flexible spending account
(FSA) information from an iPad, along with access to products such as W-2s and pay stubs.

Use of the Paychex Online Mobile app requires a Paychex Online Single Sign-on account.
Once registered, the same single user name and password used to gain access on a laptop
or PC is also used for tablet access. There’s no additional setup or different login. Employers
don’t have to use the tablet app for their employees to use it. If the employer has a single
sign-on account, an employee can gain access to the tablet app with a user name and
password provided by the client’s administrator.

With the launch of the tablet app, Paychex also unveiled a newly expanded landing page
and message center that users see when they sign in. This landing page, or dashboard, has
a new, consolidated message center that puts all the immediate information about the
products a user has in one place. And, it provides the full features and functionality of
Paychex Online Services.

“With our iPad app, Paychex clients and their employees can do anything that they now do
over the Web on a PC or laptop. They have the same full administrative rights. For instance,
clients can input and process payroll. And not only can employees see their 401(k) balance,
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they can also go in and make adjustments to their 401(k),” said Michael E. Gioja, Paychex
senior vice president of information technology, product management and development. “We
brought the tools our clients need to the surface in our dashboard and presented them in a
way that lets users get in and out quickly – anytime, anywhere. That means they can get
back to their business faster, which helps boost productivity.”

Another key feature of the expanded landing page is a “Report Favorites” section, which a
user can customize based on what products they use most. This function will benefit clients
with more than one business and members of the accounting profession who serve multiple
clients. CPAs can flag, see, and easily switch between reports for all of their clients right
from their “Report Favorites.” The accounting community has a longtime strategic
relationship with Paychex, which is the preferred provider of payroll and retirement plan
services for AICPA Trusted Business AdvisorSM Solutions.

Paychex Client Perspective

The office manager for a long-time Paychex client said she is looking forward to the ease
and convenience of transmitting payroll on the go with the new Paychex iPad app. Amie Fox
is with Mike Lauterborn Enterprises, a commercial and residential electrical contracting
business in Rochester, N.Y. Fox said the company has used Paychex Online Services since
2006, providing desktop and laptop access, but she looks forward to the new, additional
mobility.

“With the new Paychex Online Mobile iPad app, I can use my iPad to run our company’s
payroll virtually anywhere, on my schedule,” Fox added.

Paychex Online Mobile app requirements

To use the Paychex Online Mobile app, clients must have a Paychex Online Services user
name, password, and PIN, acquired with creation of a Paychex Online Single Sign-on
account. Users also must have a wireless Internet connection and an Apple iPad.

The Paychex Online Mobile app is available to download, at no cost, from the Apple App
Store for iPad.

Editor’s notes: An image of the Paychex Online Mobile app landing page and a 30-second
promotional video are available for download in the Media Kits section of the Paychex
newsroom at www.paychex.com.

Apple and iPad are registered trademarks of Apple, Inc.

About Paychex

Paychex, Inc. (NASDAQ:PAYX) is a leading provider of payroll, human resource, and
benefits outsourcing solutions for small- to medium-sized businesses. The company offers
comprehensive payroll services, including payroll processing, payroll tax administration, and
employee pay services, including direct deposit, check signing, and Readychex®. Human
resource services include 401(k) plan recordkeeping, section 125 plans, a professional
employer organization, time and attendance solutions, and other administrative services for
business. A variety of business insurance products, including group health and workers'

http://media.paychex.com/press_kits.cfm?presskit_id=4
http://finance.yahoo.com/q?s=PAYX


compensation, are made available through Paychex Insurance Agency, Inc. Paychex was
founded in 1971. With headquarters in Rochester, New York, the company has more than
100 offices serving approximately 564,000 payroll clients nationwide as of May 31, 2011. For
more information about Paychex and our products, visit www.paychex.com.

Stay Connected with Paychex

Twitter: www.twitter.com/paychex

Facebook: www.facebook.com/paychex

LinkedIn: http://www.linkedin.com/company/paychex/products

Photos/Multimedia Gallery Available: http://www.businesswire.com/cgi-bin/mmg.cgi?
eid=50094761&lang=en
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