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Futurestep Appoints Industry Veteran Vic
Khan as Managing Director, Global
Operations
LOS ANGELES--(BUSINESS WIRE)-- Futurestep, a Korn Ferry company (NYSE: KFY)
specializing in high- impact talent solutions, today has named Viquar (Vic) Khan managing
director of Global Operations to address the growing demand for its talent acquisition
solutions, as well as enhance services to existing clients. Working closely with Futurestep’s
leadership and delivery teams, Khan will focus on extending and advancing the use of the
Korn Ferry’s intellectual property within Futurestep’s service offerings and further developing
the organization’s global capability to support clients across its recruitment centers.

Khan brings a wealth of industry experience to this role, having joined from Alexander Mann
Solutions, where he established global delivery platforms for on-shoring, near-shoring and
off-shoring as the Director of Global Client/Shared Service Centers. He also substantially
grew the company’s five global delivery centers while leading strategy and operations.

“Sustaining our record growth and our ability to provide our clients with sophisticated, multi-
country and multi-service solutions requires strong leaders with both in-depth talent
acquisition expertise and a commitment to excellence,” said Byrne Mulrooney, Futurestep
Chief Executive Officer. “Vic has an impressive blend of strategic capability and operational
skills, giving him the perfect range to drive success for all of our clients. His vast global
experience and delivery expertise make him an ideal fit for our organization and our
leadership team.”

“Futurestep continues to lead the market in delivering effective talent acquisition solutions
that deliver business results for its clients,” said Khan. “I am delighted to join the team and
help implement strategies and solutions that continue to transform the way our clients attract
and retain talent with impact.”

About Futurestep

Futurestep is the global industry leader in high-impact recruitment solutions; offering fully
customized, flexible services to help organizations meet their talent and recruitment needs.

Our clients turn to us for proven expertise, a global process and infrastructure, proprietary
competency models, innovative sourcing and attraction strategies, and a unique approach to
measure and optimize business impact.

As a Korn Ferry Company, Futurestep can meet a variety of workforce requirements; from
RPO and project recruitment, to search and consulting, our solutions apply a truly world-
class capability to deliver talent with impact, providing the experience and global reach to
identify, attract and retain the people who drive business success. To learn more, visit

http://www.futurestep.com/
http://www.kornferry.com/


www.futurestep.com.

About Korn Ferry

Korn Ferry is the preeminent authority on leadership and talent. For nearly half a century,
clients have trusted us to recruit world-class leaders. Today, we are their partners in
designing organizational strategy and developing their people to achieve unimaginable
success. For more information, visit www.kornferry.com.
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