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MaxLinear and STMicroelectronics
Demonstrate Eight-Channel Ultra HD
HEVC Satellite Gateway at Broadcast Asia
Show
Gateway Combines MaxLinear’s MxL582 Full-Spectrum CaptureTM Eight-Channel Front-End
SoC with ST’s STiH412 “Monaco” HEVC 4Kp30 Ultra High Definition Decoder

CARLSBAD, Calif.--(BUSINESS WIRE)-- MaxLinear Inc. (NYSE: MXL), a leading provider of
integrated radio frequency (RF) and mixed-signal integrated circuits for broadband
communications applications, and STMicroelectronics (NYSE: STM), a global semiconductor
leader serving customers across the spectrum of electronics applications, will demonstrate a
next-generation multi-channel ultra high definition (UHD) gateway platform in ST’s booth at
Broadcast Asia in Singapore, June 17-20.

The 4K UHD satellite gateway platform, a collaboration between MaxLinear and ST, is
targeted at the growing number of satellite pay-TV operators looking to deliver broadcast 4K
services along with other value-added features such as multi-channel recording, multi-room
viewing and content streaming to multiple devices throughout the home.

“The demonstration at Broadcast Asia of this Ultra HD HEVC satellite gateway highlights the
beauty and efficiency of the reference design ST and MaxLinear announced a few months
ago,” said Hervé Mathieu, Box and Gateways Business Line Director, Unified Platform
Division, STMicroelectronics. “Attendees can’t help but recognize that UHD is providing the
next-level user experience and extraordinary opportunity for satellite broadcasters—and the
suitability of the ST/MaxLinear solution.”

The platform features the MaxLinear MxL582 Full-Spectrum CaptureTM (FSC) satellite
receiver, which captures the entire satellite RF band and provides up to eight DVB-S/S2
transport stream outputs. The MxL582 is part of the MxL5x2 family of SoC’s that feature
complete, single chip multi-channel receiver solutions with no external LNA, ultra-low power
consumption and industry-leading performance. The MxL5x2 SoC’s support single cable
(Unicable) distribution and Extended L-Band (XL-Band) input frequencies from 250 MHz to
2350 MHz.

The STiH412 from ST handles the back-end decoding and video processing in the design.
This system-on-chip provides high-efficiency video-decoding (HEVC/ H.265) multi-channel
decode, UHD display, multi-channel recording to an internal or external hard drive, video-on-
demand (VOD) and real-time transcoding of up to three streams and state-of-the-art HD
graphics.



“The combined system solution with MaxLinear front-end and ST back-end provides a very
compelling value proposition in terms of power, performance and price,” said Brian Sprague,
MaxLinear’s Vice President and General Manager. “This platform provides our customers
with a cutting-edge solution to address the growing demand for 4K home media gateways
and multi-channel streaming throughout the home.”

The ST Cannes/Monaco SoC design is based on dual-core ARM processors, superior
2D/3D graphics performance with a Mali™ GPU, integrated hardware Faroudja® multimedia
subsystem with HEVC video decoder, high-performance video encoder and high-quality
video pre- and post-processing.

Technical Highlights – MxL5x2

The MxL5x2 family includes two devices with XL-Band support, MxL582 and MxL542. The
MxL582 includes two XL-Band inputs and eight demodulators. The MxL542 includes two XL-
Band inputs and four demodulators. Both devices are pin-compatible and integrate an RF
splitter, which enables flexible designs that can support from four to 16 demodulators with
common hardware and software. MxL5x2 devices are currently in volume production and
available in a very low cost 10mm x 10mm QFN package.

The MxL5x2 devices integrate all active front-end components, including the low-noise
amplifiers (LNA). Due to the high levels of system integration, the bill of material (BOM) in
end applications is reduced to a minimal number of low-cost passive components.

The low-power and power-control flexibility of the MxL5x2 devices enable compliance with
the requirements of Energy Star and the European Code of Conduct for Digital TV Services
and Broadband Equipment, in both standby and full operating modes.

Technical Highlights - STiH412

The ‘Monaco’ SoC family provides an economical, yet full-featured solution for media server
applications. It delivers high computing capabilities based on ARM multi-core processors,
superior 2D/3D graphics performance, integrated hardware video encoders with pre-
processing and Faroudja®-enhanced video processing. The devices also feature a
comprehensive security toolbox for premium content delivery. The ST Faroudja Transcode
Engine provides best-in-class transcoding capabilities for multi-screen experiences across
consumer and handheld devices. This allows operators to reduce their network bandwidth
while offering an excellent quality of service throughout the home. The ‘Monaco’ family
includes the ‘Ultra HD’ STiH412 (4Kp30, VP8), and cost-optimized derivatives (STiH410 and
STiH407) for full HD (1080p) markets.

About MaxLinear, Inc.

MaxLinear, Inc. is a leading provider of radio-frequency and mixed-signal semiconductor
solutions for broadband communications applications. MaxLinear is headquartered in
Carlsbad, California. For more information, please visit www.maxlinear.com.

MxL, Full-Spectrum Capture, FSC and the MaxLinear logo are trademarks of MaxLinear, Inc.
Other trademarks appearing herein are the property of their respective owners.

http://www.maxlinear.com/


Cautionary Note About Forward-Looking Statements

This press release contains “forward-looking” statements within the meaning of federal
securities laws. Forward-looking statements include, among others, statements concerning
or implying future financial performance or trends and growth opportunities affecting
MaxLinear, in particular statements relating to the announcement of a next generation multi-
channel ultra high definition gateway platform based in part on the MxL582 Full-Spectrum
Capture receiver. These forward-looking statements involve known and unknown risks,
uncertainties, and other factors that may cause actual results to differ materially from any
future results expressed or implied by these forward-looking statements. We cannot predict
whether or to what extent we will realize revenues from the satellite gateway reference
design announced today. Forward-looking statements are based on management’s current,
preliminary expectations and are subject to various risks and uncertainties, including (among
others) intense competition in our industry; the ability of our customers to cancel or reduce
orders; uncertainties concerning how end user markets for our products will develop,
including the potential market for the reference design announced today; our lack of long-
term supply contracts and dependence on limited sources of supply; potential decreases in
average selling prices for our products; and pending intellectual property litigation as well as
the potential for additional intellectual property litigation, which is prevalent in our industry. In
addition to these risks and uncertainties, investors should review the risks and uncertainties
contained in MaxLinear’s filings with the United States Securities and Exchange
Commission, including risks and uncertainties identified in our Quarterly Report on Form 10-
Q for the quarter ended March 31, 2014. All forward-looking statements are qualified in their
entirety by this cautionary statement. MaxLinear is providing this information as of the date of
this release and does not undertake any obligation to update any forward-looking statements
contained in this release as a result of new information, future events, or otherwise.
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