
February 12, 2007

Microchip Technology Adds The
MathWorks Plug-Ins to Free MPLAB(R)
Integrated Development Environment
MATLAB(R), Simulink(R) and Real-Time Workshop(R) Software Plug-Ins
Added to MPLAB IDE Version 7.51

CHANDLER, Ariz.--(BUSINESS WIRE)--

Microchip Technology Inc. (NASDAQ:MCHP), a leading provider of microcontroller and
analog semiconductors, today announced that, through its close collaboration with The
MathWorks, Inc., a leading developer of technical computing and Model-Based Design
software, Microchip's popular MPLAB(R) Integrated Development Environment (IDE) now
features a free plug-in for The MathWorks MATLAB(R), Simulink(R) and Real-Time
Workshop(R) Embedded Coder modeling and code-generation programs.

MATLAB is a high-level technical computing language and interactive environment for
algorithm development, data visualization, data analysis, and numeric computation. Simulink
is a platform for multi-domain simulation and Model-Based Design of dynamic systems. With
Simulink, designers can quickly create, model and maintain a detailed block diagram of the
system, using a comprehensive set of predefined blocks. MATLAB and Simulink are used by
engineers and scientists in industry, government and education.

The MPLAB IDE is a free, feature-rich, integrated toolset for the development of embedded
applications employing Microchip's PIC(R) microcontrollers and dsPIC(R) digital signal
controllers. The MPLAB IDE runs as a 32-bit application on the Microsoft Windows(R)
operation system, is easy to use, and includes a host of free software components for fast
application development and super-charged debugging. The MPLAB IDE also serves as a
single, unified graphical user interface for additional Microchip and third party software and
hardware development tools. MATLAB and Simulink plug-ins debut in the current version of
the MPLAB IDE, version 7.51, and enable designers to select Simulink software models,
automatically generate source code, and include the files in MPLAB IDE projects for
compilation and build, all within the familiar, easy-to-use MPLAB IDE graphical user
interface.

"The integration between MATLAB, Simulink and the MPLAB IDE will dramatically increase
the productivity of production organizations using Model-Based Design with Microchip's
hardware," said Tom Erkkinen, Embedded Applications manager of The MathWorks, Inc.
"With push-button automation, engineers can now generate code from their executable
specification models, compile it, and download the code to their embedded processor for on-
target rapid prototyping or production deployment."

"Wielding the power of MATLAB and Simulink from the MPLAB IDE desktop further
empowers the designer of embedded designs using Microchip devices," said Derek Carlson,



vice president of Microchip Development Tools. "This collaboration is a significant addition to
our tool suite for Microchip's 16-bit microcontrollers, and sets the stage for future cooperative
efforts."

For additional information, contact any Microchip sales representative or authorized
worldwide distributor, or visit Microchip's Web site at www.microchip.com/mplab.

About The MathWorks

The MathWorks is the world's leading developer of technical computing and Model-Based
Design software for engineers and scientists in industry, government, and education. With
an extensive product set based on MATLAB and Simulink, The MathWorks provides
software and services to solve challenging problems and accelerate innovation in
automotive, aerospace, communications, financial services, biotechnology, electronics,
instrumentation, process, and other industries. The MathWorks was founded in 1984 and
employs more than 1,600 people worldwide, with headquarters in Natick, Massachusetts.
For additional information, visit www.mathworks.com.

Microchip Customer Support

Microchip is committed to supporting its customers by helping design engineers develop
products faster and more efficiently. Customers can access four main service areas at
www.microchip.com. The Support area provides a fast way to get questions answered; the
Sample area offers free evaluation samples of any Microchip device; microchipDIRECT
provides 24-hour pricing, ordering, inventory and credit for convenient purchasing of all
Microchip devices and development tools; finally, the Training area educates customers
through webinars, sign-ups for local seminar and workshop courses, and information about
the annual MASTERs events held throughout the world.

About Microchip Technology

Microchip Technology Inc. (NASDAQ:MCHP) is a leading provider of microcontroller and
analog semiconductors, providing low-risk product development, lower total system cost and
faster time to market for thousands of diverse customer applications worldwide.
Headquartered in Chandler, Arizona, Microchip offers outstanding technical support along
with dependable delivery and quality. For more information, visit the Microchip website at
www.microchip.com.

Note: The Microchip name and logo, PIC, dsPIC, and MPLAB are registered trademarks of
Microchip Technology Inc. in the USA and other countries. MATLAB, Simulink, and Real-
Time Workshop are registered trademarks of The MathWorks, Inc. All other trademarks
mentioned herein are the property of their respective companies.
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