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V7 Introduces Webcams for Personal and
Business Use
Starting at $14.95, Ingram Micro House Brand's New Webcams Offer Superior Images and
Sound for Live Video Conversation

SANTA ANA, Calif.--(BUSINESS WIRE)-- V7, the exclusive house brand for Ingram Micro
Inc. (NYSE: IM) and provider of premier computer accessories worldwide, today introduced
high-quality Webcams for a variety of personal and business use.

Perfect for virtual face-to-face meetings with friends, family and co-workers or for sharing
video on Facebook and YouTube, the V7 Vantage Webcam 300 captures up to 30 frames
per second at 640x480 resolution and features a high-quality VGA sensor and built-in
microphone for clear live images and sound. The manufacturer's suggested retail price
(MSRP) is $14.95.

Designed for business communications, the V7 Professional Webcam 1300 features a true
1.3-megapixel sensor, built-in microphone and video capture up to 30 frames per second at
1280x1024 resolution for superior live images and sound. MSRP is $19.95.

Featuring a true 2.0 megapixel sensor, auto focus, built-in microphone and HD video capture
at up to 1600x1200 resolution, the V7 Elite Webcam 2000 provides smoother video, sharper
pictures, rich colors and clearer sound for virtual face-to-face meetings with important
business and personal contacts. The V7 Elite Webcam 2000 is a great business value
offering the quality and performance that differentiates it from the competition. MSRP is
$29.95.

All three V7 Webcams include a combination universal clip and stand for easy mounting on
desk tops or flat-panel monitors and are compatible with Windows 2000/XP/Vista/7 operating
systems.

"The V7 Webcams offer smooth, fluid video with excellent sound quality and a choice of
video resolutions for personal or business videoconferencing," said Rainer Kozlik, vice
president and general manager of Ingram Micro's Global V7 Private Label Group. "The
Webcams are part of V7's ongoing strategy to offer high-quality products that 'surround the
PC' at an affordable price for our resellers and their customers, backed by Ingram Micro's
unsurpassed global support and logistics infrastructure."

For more information on these and other V7 products, visit www.V7-world.com or call (800)
456-8000 to speak to an Ingram Micro sales representative.

About V7

V7 is Ingram Micro's exclusive global house brand for high-quality, high-value computer
accessories and supplies, including keyboards and mice, notebook computer carrying cases,

http://www.v7-world.com


LCD monitors, cables, notebook batteries, toner, wall mounts and monitor stands.
Leveraging worldwide operational excellence, real-time market intelligence and global
sourcing power, V7 delivers state-of-the-art products at an unmatched value maximizing
return on investment for resellers and bringing higher customer satisfaction. Visit
http://www.V7-world.com.

About Ingram Micro Inc.

As a vital link in the technology value chain, Ingram Micro creates sales and profitability
opportunities for vendors and resellers through unique marketing programs, outsourced
logistics, technical and financial support, managed and cloud-based services, and product
aggregation and distribution. The company is the only global broad-based IT distributor,
serving more than 150 countries on six continents with the world's most comprehensive
portfolio of IT products and services. Visit www.ingrammicro.com.
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